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Cumbria Office of the Police & Crime Commissioner

Freedom of Information Disclosure Log

	Ref No & Date 
	Request Received
	Response Provided

	001/23
03/01/2023

	I am doing some research and have noticed that your spend data files for Jan-May, Jul, Aug 2019 and from Oct 2020 to Mar 2021 are missing/having dead links/files corrupted.
Please can you send me a CSV file with the correct data.
	Under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act 2001 this information is available on our website therefore will not be provided via this request. After checking the links on our website (https://cumbria-pcc.gov.uk/finance-governance/transparency/contracts-and-spending/), the CSV links all appear to be working and open up as a downloaded excel spreadsheet. Please let us know if you continue to have issues accessing these files. 

	002/23 
23/01/2023
	I am writing to make a request under the Freedom of Information Act.

Please could you provide me with the following information, in Excel or similar spreadsheet form if possible:
1. 
1. 
1. How much your current and previous Commissioners
1. claimed in expenses over their respective tenures in each of the past three calendar years: 2022, 2021 and 2020. 
1. 
1. 
1. 
1. The total cost of running your office (including
1. staff salaries) for each of the past three calendar years: 2022, 2021 and 2020. 
1. 
1. 
1. 
1. The number of staff, in FTE, employed by your
1. office for each of the past three calendar years: 2022, 2021 and 2020. 


	Your request has now been considered and I am able to advise you of the following:

13. Under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act 2001 this information is available on our website therefore will not be provided via this request, I have provided the link where you can access this information: https://cumbria-pcc.gov.uk/finance-governance/allowances/ 

13. Under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act 2001 this information is available on our website therefore will not be provided via this request, I have provided the link where you can access this information: https://cumbria-pcc.gov.uk/finance-governance/budget-finance/financial-statements/ 

Please note that the information is presented by Financial Year and not by calendar year so the information for 2022-23 will be published later in 2023.

13. In addition to the Police and Crime Commissioner detailed below are the number of staff who were employed by the OPCC during the past three years.  In brackets denotes whether any were temporary, seconded or funded by another organisation:

2022 – 19 members of staff
	14 full time (2 temporary)
5 part time (1 funded by Safer Cumbria/Cumbria Constabulary; 1 temporary)
2021 – 18 members of staff 
14 full time (3 temporary; 1 funded by Safer Cumbria/Cumbria Constabulary)
4 part time (1 funded by Safer Cumbria/Cumbria Constabulary)
2020 – 16 members of staff
12 full time (1 temporary; 1 funded by Safer Cumbria/Cumbria Constabulary)
4 part time (1 funded by Safer Cumbria/Cumbria Constabulary)


	003/23
14/02/2023
	I would appreciate it if you could inform me of how many children have been bereaved by domestic abuse in the past 5 years in Cumbria. Please can you include all domestic homicides and suspected suicides where domestic abuse was suspected
	The Police and Crime Commissioner does not have any statutory authority to become involved or intervene with regards to operational policing matters, and he does not have access to such information. Therefore, I can advise that the Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner does not hold the information you seek. 

	004/23 
23/02/2023
	Could you please send me the below details or your current Blue light fleet (inc Motorbikes) for market research we are undertaking -

-Model Year
-The Vehicle Make & Model
-Type of Vehicle (Example-Saloon, Wagon etc) -The Role of the Vehicle (Including Armed Response Unit) -The Year the Vehicle was Commissioned

	The Police and Crime Commissioner does not have any statutory authority to become involved or intervene with regards to operational policing matters, and he does not have access to such information. Therefore, I can advise that the Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner does not hold the information you seek. 
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